
RFP #23-015 Sand and Gravel Supplies

Total Price $196,370.00 Total Price $368,071.00 Total Price $514,648.00 Total Price $708,050.00
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Sandy Loam 5000 Ton $28.36 $141,800.00 $25.25 $126,250.00 $36.00 $180,000.00 $38.00 $190,000.00
2 3/8" Pea Gravel 1000 Ton $28.89 $28,890.00 $24.75 $24,750.00 $63.00 $63,000.00 $65.00 $65,000.00
3 Screened Red Clay 50 Ton No Bid $26.32 $1,316.00 $698.80 $34,940.00 $100.00 $5,000.00
4 Top Soil 1000 Ton $25.68 $25,680.00 $21.75 $21,750.00 $28.00 $28,000.00 $38.00 $38,000.00
5 Top Dressing Sand 750 Ton No Bid $26.50 $19,875.00 $34.64 $25,980.00 $75.00 $56,250.00
6 Beached/Washed Sand 20 Ton No Bid $26.50 $530.00 $36.40 $728.00 $65.00 $1,300.00
7 Beached/Washed Concrete Sand 5000 Ton No Bid $31.50 $157,500.00 $36.40 $182,000.00 $65.00 $325,000.00
8 3/8" Chat Rock 500 Ton No Bid $32.20 $16,100.00 No Bid $55.00 $27,500.00
9 Pick Up Site For Product 1 EA No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

10 Pick Up Site For Product 1 EA No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

Green Dream International CJA Enterprises LLP
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