
Green 

Dream Martin Marietta CJA
1 5000 TONS SANDY LOAM  $          22.73  $                      20.47 $17.75

2 1000 TONS 3/8" PEA GRAVEL  $          25.57  $                      30.47 $17.75

3 50 TONS SCREENED RED CLAY  No Bid  No Bid $21.25

4 1000 TONS TOP SOIL  $          19.81  No Bid $15.75

5 750 TONS TOPDRESSING SAND  No Bid  No Bid $20.25

6 20 TONS

BEACH WASHED SAND FOR 

VOLLEYBALL FIELD  $          27.98  $                      25.35 $20.25

7 5000 TONS

WASHED SAND CONCRETE - 

DELIEVERED  $          25.73  $                      28.97 $24.45

7B 5000 TONS

WASHED SAND CONCRETE - 

PICK UP  $          13.65  $                      25.00 No Bid

ESTIMATED DELIVERY TIME

20-006 SAND & GAVEL PRICING PROPOSAL SHEET 

US CONCRETE - REJECTED

Primary Secondary Tertiary


