Just Right Products DBA FW

WP Operations, Inc.

Big Hit Creative Group (Big Hit

Big Frog Custom T-Shirts

Bordova Outfitters LLC promo KMC Uniforms Inc. SP Designs & MFG, Inc. Express Press (Wallywaldo Workwear / TOCALLC Productions) (MACK Ink, L£d Co) Seaside Companies LLC
Scrubs Etc)
Total Price $882.23| Total Price $1,735.68| _Total Price| $1,887.75 Total Price $2,062.18| Total Price $2,286.22| _Total Price $2,349.00| _Total Price $2,369.86| _Total Price $2,537.45| Total Price $3,051.18| Total Price $3,449.40
Line # Mfgr Mfgno ary__uom Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit | Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 [industrial Long Sleeve Shirts 65/35 Red Kap SP141B 1 EA 15.13 $15.13 $19.46 $19.46 $15.00 $15.00 19.16 $19.16 $2637 26.37 52336 23.36 $23.25 23.25 526,04 26.04 52825 $28.25 32.48 $32.48
2 [Industrial Long Sleeve Shirts 65/35 Red Kap SP24LB 1 EA 18.95 $18.95 $16.97 $16.97 $17.00 $17.00 21.40 $21.40 529.87 29.87 52630 26.30 52325 23.25 52874 28.74 $31.18 $31.18 32.48 $32.48
3 [industrial Short Sleeve Shirts 65/35 Red Kap SP141B 1 EA 15.13 $15.13 $19.46 $19.46 $14, % $14.00 1632 $16.32 $22.41 22.41 52041 20.41 S21.11 2111 52334 23.34 52533 $25.33 32.48 $32.48
4 |Industrial Short Sleeve Shirts 65/35 Red Kap SP24LB 1 EA 18.95 $18.95 $16.97 $16.97 $16.00 $16.00 19.16 $19.16 $25.91 25.91 $23.36 23.36 $21.11 21.11 $26.04 26.04 $28.25 $28.25 32.48 $32.48
°  |industrial Long Sleeve Shirts 100% cotton _|Red Kap SC30LB 1 EA $20.55 $20.55 $26.12 $26.12 $19.50 $19.50 $28.09 $28.09 $31.57 $31.57 $32.34 $32.34 $31.28 $31.28 $36.29 $36.29 $44.89 $44.89 $43.97 $43.97
©  |industriat Long Sleeve Shirts 100% cotton _|Red Kap SC30LB 1 EA $21.55 $21.55 $26.12 $26.12 $21.50 $21.50 $28.09 $28.09 $35.07 $35.07 $32.34 $32.34 $31.28 $31.28 $36.29 $36.29 $44.89 $44.89 $46.97 $46.97
7 |industrial short steeve shirts 100% cotton_|Red Kap SC40LB 1 EA $20.03 $20.03 $23.92 $23.92 $18.50 $18.50 $25.59 $25.59 $31.20 $31.29 $29.62 $29.62 528.07 $28.07 $35.94 $35.94 $41.41 $41.41 54075 $40.75
8 |industrial Short leeve shirts 100% cotton | Red Kap SC40LB 1 EA $21.03 $21.03 23.92 $23.92 $20.50 $20.50 $25.59 25.59 34.79 $34.79 $29.62 29.62 28.07 $28.07 $35.94 $35.94 $41.41 $41.41 $43.75 43.75
9 [industrial Pants 65/35 Regular Cut Red Kap PT20NV 1 EA $17.68| $17.68 19.95 $19.95 $19.50 $19.50 52005 20.05 1931 $19.31 $23.96 23.96 27.53 $27.53 52132 $21.32 523.08 $23.08 526,32 26.32
10 [industrial Pants 65/35 Regular Cut Red Kap PT20NV 1 EA $17.68 $17.68 19.95 $19.95 521.50 $21.50 52132 21.32 19.31 $19.31 $25.43 25.43 27.53 $27.53 522,67 $22.67 524.54 $24.54 29.32 29.32
11 [Industrial Pants 65/35 Jean Cut Red Kap C798DN 1 EA $18.95 $18.95 27.11 $27.11 525.50 $25.50 $29.21 29.21 32.22 $32.22 528.60 28.60 32.88 $32.88 $31.05 $31.05 $39.56 $39.56 34.63 34.63
12 |[industrial Pants 65/35 Jean Cut Red Kap C798DN 1 EA $18.95 $18.95 27.11 $27.11 527.50 $27.50 29.21 29.21 32.22 $32.22 28.60 28.60 32.88 $32.88 $31.05 $31.05 $39.56 $39.56 34.63 34.63
13 [T-Shirts 50/50 with pocket Gildan 8300 1 EA $7.62 $7.62 $8.30 $8.30 $9.50 $9.50 10.20 $10.20 10.44 $10.44 13,61 13.61 14.15 $14.15 $19.70 $19.70 17.13 17.13 2143 21.43
14__|T-Shirts 50/50 with pocket Gildan 8300 1 EA $11.08 $11.08 516.07 $16.07 $11.00 $11.00 14.81 $14.81 13.44 $13.44 17.59 17.59 16.29 $16.29 52635 $26.35 22.85 22.85 28.37 28.37
15 [T-Shirts 100% Cotton with Pocket Gildan 2300 1 EA 7.55 57.55 $9.26 $9.26 5$10.00 $10.00 12.12 $12.12 10.36 $10.36 1353 1353 15.22 $15.22 520,05 $20.05 17.04 17.04 2135 21.35
16 _|T-Shirts 100% Cotton with pocket Gildan 2300 1 EA $10.01 $10.01 $13.26 $13.26 $11.50 $11.50 13.76 $13.76 13.36 $13.36 16.31 1631 21.64 $21.64 524.68 $24.68 20.63 20.63 27.07 27.07
17 |Long Sleeve T-Shirts 100% Cotton with
pocket Port&Co _ |PC6ILSP. 1 EA $8.57 $8.57 $10.16 $10.16 $10.50 $10.50 $1137 $11.37 $10.86 $10.86 514.68 $14.68 $14.43 $14.43 $21.10 $21.10 $18.52 $18.52 $22.65 $22.65
g |LonB Sleeve T-Shirts 100% Cotton with
pocket Port&Co |PC61LSP 1 EA $9.57 $9.57 $13.16 $13.16 $12.00 $12.00 $14.10 $14.10 $13.86 $13.86 $17.27 $17.27 $22.71 $22.71 $24.53 $24.53 521.87 $21.87 526.88 $26.88
993RB or
" |REG FIT JEAN 13.75 ou denim DICKIES 9393 1 EA $21.58 $21.58 $24.84 $24.84. $24.50 $24.50 $26.67 $26.67 $28.37 $28.37 $23.90 $23.90 $20.14 $29.14 $23.04 $23.04 $24.95 $24.95 $31.60 $31.60
50 |INDUSTRAIL CARPENTER JEAN 13.75 ou LU20RB or
denim DICKIES 19294 1 EA 23.08 $23.08 $26.89 $26.89 $25.00 $25.00 $27.31 $27.31 $30.26 $30.26 $27.57 $27.57 $32.88 $32.88 $24.84 $24.84 $26.89 $26.89 $33.02 $33.02
993RB or
?! |REG FIT JEAN 13.75 ou denim DICKIES 9393 EA $22.58 $22.58 $24.84 $24.84. $26.50 $26.50 $26.67 $26.67 $28.37 $28.37 $26.32 $26.32 $20.14 $29.14 $28.90 $28.90 $20.83 $29.83 $31.60 $31.60
5, |INDUSTRAIL CARPENTER JEAN 13.75 ou LU20RB or
denim DICKIES 19294 1 EA $24.08 $24.08 26.89 $26.89 $27.00 $27.00 27.31 $27.31 $30.26 $30.26 $30.37 $30.37 $32.88 $32.88 $27.36 27.36 $29.63 $29.63 $33.02 $33.02
23 [L/S Work Shirts(65/35 Blend) Red Cap SP14GY 1 EA 51513 $15.13 19.46 $19.46 $15.00 $15.00 19.16 $19.16 526,37 26.37 52336 23.36 $23.25 23.25 526,04 26.04 52825 $28.25 $32.48 $32.48
24 |L/S Work Shirts(65/35 Blend) Red Cap SP14GY 1 EA $16.13 $16.13 19.46 $19.46 $17.00 $17.00 21.40 $21.40 52937 29.37 52630 26.30 52325 23.25 52874 28.74 53118 $31.18 $35.82 $35.82
25 [5/SWork Shirts (65/35 Blend) Red Cap SP24GY 1 EA $12.43 12.43 16.97 $16.97 $14.00 $14.00 1632 $16.32 $22.41 22.41 52041 20.41 $21.11 2111 52334 23.34 52533 25.33 $29.15 $29.15
26 __|s/sWork Shirts (65/35 Blend) Red Cap SP24GY 1 EA $13.43 13.43 16.97 $16.97 516.00 $16.00 19.16 $19.16 $25.41 25.41 52336 23.36 52111 2111 526.04 26.04 28.25 28.25 32.48 $32.48
27 [L/S 100% Cotton Work Shirt Red Cap SC30GY. 1 EA 520,55 20.55 $26.12 26.12 $19.50 $19.50 $28.09 28.09 $31.57 $31.57 $32.34 $32.34 $31.28 $31.28 $36.29 $36.29 44.89 44.89 43.97 43.97
28 |L/S 100% Cotton Work Shirt Red Cap SC30GY 1 EA $21.55 21.55 526.12 26.12 $21.50 $21.50 528.09 28.09 $34.57 $34.57 53234 $32.34 $31.28 $31.28 $36.29 $36.29 44.89 44.89 46.97 46.97
29 [5/5100% Cotton Work Shirt Red Cap SC40GY. 1 EA 520,03 20.03 $23.92 23.92 $18.50 $18.50 $25.59 2559 $31.29 $31.29 529.62 $29.62 528,07 $28.07 $35.94 $35.94 41.41 41.41 40.75 40.75
30 _[5/5 100% Cotton Work Shirt Red Cap 5C40GY 1 EA $21.03 21.03 $23.92 23.92 $20.50 $20.50 $25.59 25.59 $34.29 $34.29 529.62 $29.62 528.07 $28.07 $35.94 $35.94 41.41 41.41 43.75 43.75
* L/SPocket Ts 100% Cotton Port & Co PC61LSP. 1 EA $8.57 $8.57 $10.16 $10.16 $10.50 $10.50 $13.87 $13.87 $8.00| $8.00 $15.94 $15.94 $18.43 $18.43 $21.10 $21.10 $18.52 $18.52 $22.65 $22.65
2 L/SPocket Ts 100% Cotton w/Silkscreen Port & Co PC61LSP 1 EA $9.57 $9.57 $13.16 $13.16 $12.00 $12.00 $16.60 $16.60 $11.00 $11.00 $18.53 $18.53 $22.71 $22.71 $24.53 $24.53 $21.87 $21.87 $26.88 $26.88
» S/S Pocket Ts 50/50 Blend with silkscreen | Gildan 8300 1 EA $7.62 $7.62 $8.30 $8.30 $9.50 $9.50 $12.70 $12.70 $7.58| $7.58 $14.87 $14.87 $14.15 $14.15 $19.70 $19.70 $17.13 $17.13 $21.43 $21.43
3% |s/5 pocket Ts 50/50 Blend with sikscreen | Gildan 8300 1 EA $11.08 $11.08 $16.07 $16.07 $11.00 $11.00 $17.31 $17.31 $10.58 $10.58 $18.85 $18.85 $16.29 $16.29 52635 $26.35 $22.85 $22.85 52837 $28.37
» S/S Pocket Ts 100% Cotton Gildan 2300 1 EA $7.55 $7.55 $9.26 $9.26 $10.00 $10.00 $12.68 $12.68 $7.50| $7.50 $14.79 $14.79 $15.22 $15.22 $20.05 $20.05 $17.04 $17.04 $21.35 $21.35
35 |s/s pocket Ts 100% Cotton wiSilkscreen | Gildan 2300 1 EA $10.01 $10.01 $13.26 $13.26 $11.50 $11.50 $16.25 $16.25 $10.50 $10.50 $17.57 $17.57 52164 $21.64 524.68 $24.68 52063 $20.63 $27.07 $27.07
37 |55 SAFETY SHIRT DRI-WICK W/STENCILON
BACK Corner Stone |CS408 1 EA $15.59 $15.59 $18.65 $18.65 $18.75 $18.75 $20.73 $20.73 $14.81 $23.57 $23.57 $28.06 $28.06 $22.94 $22.94 $25.54 $25.54 $31.65 $31.65
35 |SS SAFETY SHIRT DRI-WICK W/STENCILON
BACK Corner Stone |CS408 1 EA $16.59 $16.59 $23.77 $23.77 $20.75 $20.75 $24.12 $24.12 $17.81 $25.04 $25.04 $34.48 $34.48 $28.34 $28.34 $27.00 $27.00 $38.32 $38.32
39 |5 SAFETY SHIRT DRI-WICK W/STENCILON
BACK Corner Stone |€5409 1 EA $18.19 $18.19 $22.79 $22.79 $20.50 $20.50 $23.27 $23.27 $17.41 $26.51 $26.51 $32.34 $32.34 $25.64 $25.64 $28.46 $28.46 $34.98 $34.98
40 | SAFETY SHIRT DRI-WICK W/STENCILON
BACK Corner Stone |CS409 1 EA $19.19 $19.19 $23.79 $23.79 $22.50 $22.50 $26.33 $26.33 $20.41 $27.98 $27.98 $38.76 $38.76 $31.04 $31.04 $29.92 $29.92 $41.65 $41.65
41 |Sarety Hoodie W/Stencil on Back & LOGO LUX-
on front Occunomix _|SWTHZBK |1 EA No Bid $48.95 $48.95 $49.00 $49.00 $42.23 $42.23 $49.36 $49.36 $48.83 $48.83 $37.70 $37.70 $56.34 $56.34 $75.47 $75.47 $85.07 $85.07
42 |Safety Hoodie W/Stencil on Back & LOGO LUX-
on front Occunomix _|SWTHZBK |1 EA No Bid $51.95 $51.95 $49.00 $49.00 $42.23 $42.23 $52.36 $52.36 $48.83 $48.83 37.70 $37.70 $56.34 $56.34 $75.47 $75.47 $90.07 $90.07
3 Cold weather jacket W/Stencil on Back &
LOGO on front Occunomix _|LUX-TICW |1 EA No Bid $87.95 $87.95 $79.00 $79.00 $76.34 $76.34 $94.89 $94.89 $98.36 $98.36 $70.87 $70.87 $97.47 $97.47 $133.65 $133.65 $151.40 $151.40
44 |Cold weather jacket W/Stencil on Back &
LOGO on front Occunomix _|LUX-TICW |1 EA No Bid $90.95 $90.95 $79.00 $79.00 $76.34 $76.34 $97.89 $97.89 $98.36 $98.36 $70.87 $70.87 $97.47 $97.47 $133.62 $133.62 $156.40 $156.40
45 | Cold weather Bibs Occunomix__|SP-BIBBY |1 EA No Bid $157.75 $157.75 $124.00 $124.00 $145.97 $145.97 $156.82 5156.82 $159.07 $159.07 $127.58 $127.58 $153.90 $153.90 $198.75 $198.75 $243.90 $243.90
46__|Cold weather Bibs Occunomix _|SP-BIB-BY |1 EA No Bid $160.75 $160.75 $124.00 $124.00 $145.97 $145.97 $159.82 $159.82 $159.07 $159.07 $127.58 512758 $153.90 $153.90 $198.75 5198.75 $248.90 5248.90
47 _|Safari Safety Hats Yellow w/logo Occunomix _|LUX-RNG |1 EA No Bid 51339 $13.39 $13.25 $13.25 $1232 $12.32 $15.72 $15.72 $13.93 $13.93 $12.02 $12.02 $9.29] $9.29 527.04 $27.04 528.82 $28.82
48 __|Outdoor Cap Mesh Back Outdoor MBW600 |1 EA No Bid $12.00 $12.00 $9.00 $9.00 $10.76 $10.76 $7.78 $7.78 $10.94 $10.94 $15.58 $15.58 $9.18 59.18 514.81 $14.81 52275 $22.75
49 |Class 3 Rain Jacket w/Reflective Radian RW30-321Y |1 EA Po Bid No Bid 560.00 $60.00 $56.82 $56.82 $73.52 $73.52 $63.36 $63.36 $54.82 $54.82 77.49 77.49 $115.87 511587 $111.65 $111.65
50 |Class 3 Rain Jacket w/Reflective Radian RW30-321Y |1 EA No Bid ho Bid $60.00 $60.00 $56.82 $56.82 $76.52 $76.52 $63.36 $63.36 $54.82 $54.82 77.49 77.49 $124.38 $124.38 $116.65 $116.65
51 |Class 3 rain bibs Pants w/Reflective Radian RW30-ES1Y_[1 EA [No Bid [No Bid $53.00 $53.00 $51.46 $51.46 $60.50 $60.50 $50.43 $50.43 $51.45 $51.45 54.58 54.58 $72.99 $72.99 586,32 $86.32
52| Class 3 rain bibs Pants w/Reflective Radian RW30-ES1Y |1 EA No Bid No Bid $53.00 $53.00 $51.46 $51.46 $63.50 $63.50 $50.43 $50.43 $51.45 $51.45 54.58 54.58 $76.23 $76.23 $89.32 $89.32
- 993RB or
REG FIT JEAN 13.75 ou denim Dickies 9393 1 EA $24.84 $24.84. $24.50 $24.50 $26.67 $26.67 $35.56 $35.56 $23.90 $23.90 $20.14 $29.14 $23.04 $23.04 $24.95 $24.95 $31.60 $31.60
993RB or
> |REG FIT JEAN 13.75 ou denim Dickies 9393 1 EA $24.84 $24.84 $24.50 $24.50 $26.67 $26.67 $35.56 $35.56 $26.32 $26.32 $29.14 $29.14 $28.90 $28.90 $29.83 $29.83 $31.60 $31.60
= LU20RB or
Industrial Relaxed Fit Carpenter Jeans Dickies 19294 1 EA $26.89 $26.89 $25.00 $25.00 $27.31 $27.31 $30.26 $30.26 $27.57 $27.57 $32.88 $32.88 $24.84 $24.84 $26.89 $26.89 $33.02 $33.02
LU20RB or
55 | industrial Relaxed Fit Carpenter Jeans Dickies 19294 1 EA X $26.89 $26.89 $27.00 $27.00 $27.31 $27.31 $30.26 $30.26 $30.37 $30.37 $32.88 $32.88 $27.36 $27.36 $29.58 $29.58 $33.02 $33.02
57 _|Men's Red-E-Prest Work Pant Red Kap PT10 1 EA $20.61 $20.61 $19.95 $19.95 $22.50 $22.50 $25.55 $25.55 528.64 $28.64 52816 $28.16 $31.28 $31.28 $27.18 $27.18 $34.99 $34.99 $32.40 $32.40
%8 |100% Cotton - short sleeve with Pocket | ildan 62300 1 EA $7.55 $7.55 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $9.68 $9.68 $7.76 $7.76 $14.79 $14.79 $15.22 $15.22 $20.05 $20.05 $17.04 $17.04 $15.10 $15.10
59 [100% Cotton - Short Sleeve Gildan 65000 1 EA $3.72 $3.72 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $5.27 $5.27 $3.96 $3.96 51046 $10.46 $8.80 $8.80 $16.07 $16.07 $11.43 $11.43 $9.22 $9.22
5 |100% Cotton - Short Sleeve with Pocket | Gildan 62300 1 EA $10.01 $10.01 13.00 13.00 $11.50 $11.50 $13.62 $13.62 51076 $10.76 17.57 $17.57 21.64 $21.64 $23.53 23.53 20.63 $20.63 20.82 $20.82
61 [100% Cotton - Short Sleeve Gildan 65000 1 EA $7.67 57.67 12.00 12.00 $9.50 $9.50 $8.65 $8.65 $6.96] $6.96 13.24 $13.24 14.15 $14.15 $20.17 20.17 15.03 $15.03 1525 $15.25
62__|100% Cotton - Long Sleeve with Pocket Gildan 62410 1 EA $10.79 $10.79 14.85 14.85 $12.50 $12.50 512.85 $12.85 510.99 $10.99 18.46 $18.46 2057 $20.57 $23.41 23.41 21.77 21.77 19.25 $19.25
63 [100% Cotton - Long Sleeve Gildan GIL-2400 1 EA $7.88 57.88 13.10 13.10 $9.00 $9.00 $9.17 $9.17 $7.75 $7.75 15.16 $15.16 16.29 $16.29 $2039 20.39 17.51 17.51 1437 $14.37
64| 100% Cotton - Long Sleeve with Pocket Gildan 62410 1 EA $15.15 $15.15 16.85 16.85 $14.00 $14.00 516.18 $16.18 $13.99 $13.99 20.78 $20.78 25.92 $25.92 527.93 27.93 24.77 24.77 19.25 $19.25
65 [100% Cotton - Long Sleeve Gildan GIL-2400 1 EA $12.08 $12.08 16.10 $16.10 $10.50 $12.55 $12.55 $1075 $10.75 17.51 $17.51 2164 $21.64 $24.75 24.75 520.55 20.55 1437 $14.37
6 |ANSI Class 3 Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirt
with Black Bottom Radians 51323265 [1 EA No Bid No Bid $56.00 $56.00 $48.31 $48.31 $65.51 $65.51 $77.56 $77.56 $51.61 $51.61 $54.05 $54.05 $49.45 $49.45 $97.90 $97.90
67 __|3in 1 Weatherproof Parka Radians 1 EA ha Bid ha Bid 597.00] $97.00 $106.39 $106.39 $84.18 $84.18 $54.07 $54.07 $128.84 $128.84 $80.99 $80.99 $115.95 $115.95 $148.15 $148.15
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68 __|Snapback Trucker Cap [Richardson _[112 1 [eA [ $9.58 $9.58 $16.00 $16.00 10.50] $10.50 $9.81 $9.81 10.62 $10.62 13.56 13.56 518.99 $18.99 15.93 $15.93 518.52 $18.52 517.15 $17.15
69 [Beanie Carhartt Al8) 1 [ea [No Bid 520.00 $20.00 u.# $12.50 16.51 $16.51 1633 $16.33 14.71 14.71 $23.79 $23.79 18.90 $18.90 52046 $20.46 52333 $2333
70 _|Beanie Carhartt Al8 1 [eA No Bid $20.00 $20.00 17.00 $17.00 16.51 $16.51 1633 $16.33 14.71 14.71 523.79 $23.79 18.90 $18.90 52046 $20.46 52333 $23.33
71 |65/35 short sleeve work shirt Red Kap SP14GY 1 [ea 51513 $15.13 $19.46 $19.46 $15.00 $15.00 16.32 $16.32 52241 $22.41 52041 $20.41 $23.25 $23.25 $26.04 $26.04 $2533 $2533 $32.48 $32.48
72__|65/35 short sleeve work shirt Red Kap SP24GY 1 [eA $18.95 $18.95 $19.46 $19.46 $17.00 $17.00 19.16 $19.16 $25.41 $25.41 $23.36 $23.36 21.11 21.11 52874 $28.74 28.25 28.25 $35.82 $35.82
73 idery City logo 1 line 1 [ea $3.75 $3.75 4.00 4.00 $3.00 $3.00 50.00 $3.50 $3.50 $9.99 $9.99 13.88 13.88 | No Bid 11.00 11.00 $10.00 $10.00
74| Embroidery City logo 2 lines 1 [eA $3.75 $3.75 4.00 4.00 $0.00 50.00 $2.75 $3.50 $3.50 511.99 $11.99 13.88 13513:; Bid 14.00 14.00 510.00 $10.00
75 idery Competitive logo 1 eA $3.75 $3.75 4.00 4.00 $3.00 $3.00 50.00 $3.50 $3.50 $3.99 $3.99 13.88 13.83#0 Bid 12.00 12.00 $10.00 $10.00
76 _|Silkscreen One Side 1 EA $3.00 $3.00 2.44 2.44 $1.75 $1.75 $0.00 $0.75 $0.75 $13.10 $13.10 $7.87 $7.87 | No Bid 12.50 12.50 $5.42 $5.42
77__[silkscreen Two Sides 1 [ea $3.00 $3.00 $2.44 S2.44 $1.75 $1.75 $1.45 $1.50 $1.50 $16.20 $16.20 $1076 $10.76[No Bid $25.00 $25.00 $8.33 $8.33
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