15-007 FERTILIZER

WINFIELD BWI HARRELL'S INC Justin Seed John Deere Helena Chemical

Unit Price Extended]| Unit Price Extended] Unit Price Extended|Unit Price Extended]| Unit Price Extended| Unit Price Extended
l]erzhs/l EE?ERIPT:OIE:_ : Qty PER Price PER Price PER Price PER Price PER Price PER Price
. -3- ranular 1ur
Fertilizers 1000 BAGS  [$ 1800 $ 1800000 1356 $ 18560.00 |$  21.61 $ 21,610.00 | $17.575 $17,575.000{$ 2071 '$ 20,71000 [$  18.28  $18,280.00
2.18-24-12 Starter (50Ib 10lBAGS NO BID s 1037
baas) 37§ 10370 |$ 2296 $  229.60 NO BID $ 1072 $ 19720 |$ 1812 $ 181.20
3. 28-0-0 (50Ib bags) 1600 BAGS % 16-35‘$ 26,160.00 |$ 1595 g 2552000 [$  17.75 | $ 28400.00 | $12.675 $20,280.000[$  18.62 |$ 29,792.00 [$  14.93 $23,888.00
4: 28—9—0 ferul:zerw/ 1200 BAGS
g"g?g{gew?"s?{n%‘;ine NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
: 800 BAGS
overlav (50lb baas)
6. Ronstar G (50b bags) 80BAGS  [$ 64'°°‘$ 5120.00|$ 7567 ¢ 05360 |$ 8180 $ 6,544.00 $ 7114 $ 569120 [$ 70.00 $ 5,600.00
7. 28-0-3 : Total Nitrogen
28% (26 7% Urea 160BAGS NO BID $ 1178 $ 188480|$ 2030 $ 3,248.00 $ 1678 $ 2,684.80 NO BID
8. Pendimethalin Pre-
emeraent (spring time 800 BAGS  |$ 1045 '$ 8360.00f$ 1077 'g 841600 |$ 1500 $ 12,000.00 $ 1374 $ 1099200 |$ 975 $ 7,800.00
9. Top Choice ant killer 120 BAGS  |$ 12500 $ 1500000 |$  125.00
6000lbs. : ,000. 00 ' 1500000 |$ 125.00 $ 15,000.00 NO BID $ 137.50 $ 16,500.00 |$ 125.00 $ 15,000.00
TOTAL FOR ALL ITEMS $ 72,640.00 75,828.10 | $ 87,031.60 $37,855.000 $ 86,567.20 | $ 70,749.20
Length of this price CONTRACT 125 PRICE IS FUR MURE
areement shall he for TERM 6 MONTH THAN 20 BAGS ON A 1 YEAR 24 MONTHS 12 MONTHS (7 MONTHS) 10/01/2015




