
Item Quantity

Request 

Product Size Description

Request 

Pricing 

Product 

Packaging

1.   128 oz.

4 x 1.6 oz. 

packets

Merit 75 (or 

equivalent) WG, 4 cases 32 oz. per case  $                 384.00  $             330.00  No Bid  $          361.00  $         500.00  $           344.80 

2.   100 LBS 1 LB cans Acephate 75 wg

8 cases + 4 

cans 12 cans per case  $              1,050.00  $             849.99  No Bid  $          767.00  $         975.00  $           976.00 

3.   150 LBS 2 lb. canisters

Advion fire ant 

bait

9 cases + 3 

bottles) 8 bottles per case  $              2,100.00  $          2,100.00  No Bid  $       2,186.25  $      2,418.75  $        2,505.00 

4.   20 gals 2.5g bottle

PRIMO (or 

equivalent) 4 cases 2 bottles per case  $              2,320.00  $          2,800.00  No Bid  $       2,445.00  $      3,250.00  $        2,719.84 

5.   150 gal. 2.5 gal.       Round Up/Pro 30 cases 2 bottles per case  $              2,212.80  $          1,755.00  $           1,960.50  $       2,295.00  $      2,265.60  $        2,827.80 

6.   80 bottles 1.3 oz.    Sedge-Hammer                            8 cases

10 bottles per 

case  $              5,680.00  $          6,400.00  No Bid  $       4,648.00  $      5,336.00  $        5,229.60 

7.   150 gals. 2.5 gal.   3-Way (24D) 30 cases 2 bottles per case  $              3,247.20  $          3,487.50  No Bid  $       2,690.00  $      3,420.00  $        3,793.80 

8.   500 gal. 2.5 gal   Aqua-Master                     100 cases 2 bottles per case  $              9,250.00  $          9,975.00  $           9,210.00  $       5,149.00  $    11,870.00  $      12,898.00 

9.  

200 

grams

5 x 5-gram 

packets Monument 8 boxes

25 grams per 

bottle  $              1,920.00  $          1,920.00  No Bid  $       1,920.00  $      1,920.00  $        1,920.00 

10.   100 lbs. 5 lbs. bottle Sure-Guard 5 cases 4 bottles per case  $            11,880.00  $        12,000.00  $           6,500.00  $     12,682.00  $    13,200.00  $      14,087.20 

11

 800 

ounces

 6 oz. bottles (8-

12 per case)  Tribute Total 40 cases

20 bottles per 

case  $          260,720.00  $        43,344.70  No Bid  $     43,670.00  $  156,432.00  $      78,216.00 

12.   500  gal.  2.5 gal.

Spi-Max Blue 

Dye Indicator 100 cases 2 bottles per case  $            13,600.00  $        22,500.00  $           8,000.00  $     14,370.00  $    12,150.00  $        8,268.00 

13.   500 gal.               1 gal 

Aquatic 

Surfactant  - Red 

River 125 cases 4 bottles per case  $              6,875.00  $          7,125.00  $           4,390.00  nb  N/B  No Bid 

14.   750 gal. 2.5 GAL

Surfactant  - Surf-

AC 820            

187 case + 2 

bottles 4 bottles per case  $            13,352.25  $        10,687.50  No Bid  $       6,127.50  $    10,278.00  $      10,837.50 
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