
ITEM QTY DESC.  Lattimore  Redi-Mix Custome-Crete
1 3,000 PSI 300 CU YD PICK UP  $       104.00  $     105.50  No Bid 
2 3,000 PSI 300 CU YD DELIVERED  $       113.00  $     114.50  $            132.90 
3 3,500 PSI 100 CU YD PICK UP  $       107.00  $     108.50  No Bid 
4 3,500 PSI 100 CU YD DELIVERED  $       116.00  $     117.50  $            135.90 
5 4,000 PSI 1800 CU YD PICK UP  $       110.00  $     111.50  No Bid 
6 4,000 PSI 4500 CU YD DELIVERED  $       119.00  $     120.50  $            138.00 
7 4,500 PSI 100 CU YD PICK UP  $       113.00  $     114.50  No Bid 
8 4,500 PSI 100 CU YD DELIVERED  $       122.00  $     123.50  $            141.90 
9 5,000 PSI 500 CU YD PICK UP  $       116.00  $     117.50  No Bid 
10 5,000 PSI 500 CU YD DELIVERED  $       125.00  $     126.50  $            144.90 

11

QUICK 
FORMING 
CONCRETE - 
DELIVERED 306 CU YD

QUICK SET –
6 HOUR  No Bid  No Bid  $            240.90 

12

QUICK 
FORMING 
CONCRETE - 
DELIVERED 150 CU YD

QUICK SET –
12 HOUR  No Bid  No Bid  $            233.90 

13  16.50/cyd  $       16.50 

14  15 miles  8 miles  11 mins 

15  24 hours  25 min 
Primary 
Vendor

Secondary 
Vendor

DELIVERY COST MUST BE INCLUDED IN UNIT COST.

Variations from the aforementioned Specifications may be acceptable provided such differences are noted on the bid and 
are deemed to be advantageous to the City. Any substitutions from brand names mentioned must be proved to be equal and 

may be considered for award by the Purchasing Manager and requesting department if so proven. 

Bid # 19-020 CONCRETE

Distance from plant to intersection of PGBT - 190 Josey 
Lane

Normal delivery time

Additional Price per cubic yard
Fiber mesh 650 or “approved equivalent” macro-


