Fortiline Main APSCO
QUANT
ITEM TYPE ITY DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
"Compression Couplings & T1€es - Fora
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 100 [34” Comp. Coupling - C4433G-NL | $ 15.29 $15.62000 $16.35000
Compression Coupimgs & 1€es - rord
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 35 |1" Comp. Coupling - C4444G-NL | $ 17.50 $17.87000 $18.70000
[[Compression Couplings & 1ees - rord T Va comp. coupling - C4455G-
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 2 NL $ 30.20 $30.86000 $32.35000
Compression Couplings & 1ees - rord T 72 Comp. Coupling - C4266G-
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 5 NL $ 58.51 $59.80000 $62.45000
"Compression Couplings & T1€es - Fora
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 15 |2” Comp. Coupling - C4477G-NL | $ 79.00 $80.73000 $84.30000
Compression Couplings & T€es - Fora o X V4 X 74 Comp. 1€e - 1222~
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 2 333G-NL $ 37.00 $37.80000 $39.50000
Compression Couplings & Tees - Ford A X 314 X I Comp. 1ee - 1444~
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 2 443G-NL $ 40.64 $41.54000 $43.40000
Compression Couplings & T€es - Fora T X I X I Comp. 1€€ - 1222~
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 2 444G-NL $ 39.59 $40.46000 $42.25000
Compression Couplings & Tees - Ford T X T X7 Comp. Tee - 1422-
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 2 334G-NL $ 39.42 $40.28000 $42.10000
Cast Couplings FORD ONLY 10 [ Cast Couplings - FC3-1055 | $ 25.93 $26.49000 $23.35000
Cast Couplings FORD ONLY 5 1" Cast Couplings - FC3-132-5 $ 28.25 $28.87000 $23.40000
Cast Couplings FORD ONLY 5 |1 7 Cast Couplings - FC3-166-5 | $ 38.41 $29.03000 $25.60000
Cast Couplings FORD ONLY 5 1 1/2" Cast Coupling - FC3-190-5 | $ 32.96 $33.68000 $29.65000
Cast Couplings FORD ONLY 10 |2 Cast Coupling - FC3-238-5 $ 45.16 $46.15000 $38.50000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 100 |34” Close Brass Nipple $ 1.84 $1.61000 $1.65000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 150 |¥% X 3 Brass Nipple 3 3.09 $2.72000 $2.80000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 180 |34" X 6 Brass Nipple $ 5.89 $5.17000 $5.15000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 20 |1 X 1 Brass Nipple 3 2.70 $2.37000 $2.35000]
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 50 |1 X 3 Brass Nipple $ 4.48 $3.93000 $3.95000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 10 |1 X 6 Brass Nipple 3 8.59 $7.55000 $7.85000]
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 1 % X 2 Brass Nipple $ 5.70 $5.01000 $5.10000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 15 |1 % X 3 Brass Nipple 3 7.85 $6.91000 $7.05000]
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 172" X 6 Brass Nipple $ 15.10 $13.29000 $13.85000
[Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 100 |2 X 3 Brass Nipple 3 10.05 $8.84000 $9.10000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 10 |2 X 6 Brass Nipple $ 19.42 $17.08000 $17.50000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 10 |2 X 12 Brass Nipple $ 38.27 $33.67000 $34.00000
Y& X 1 Bushing C.C. Threads
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 25 |BBAA-43-NL $ 10.69 $10.91000 $11.30000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 250 |1 X 34" Brass Bushing - C18-34-NL| $ 3.93 $4.02000 $4.20000
1T X717 Brass bushing - C13-45-
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 NL $ 7.58 $7.75000 $8.15000
172 X 3/4 brass I:suanng - Clo-50
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 NL $ 15.93 $16.28000 $13.50000
172" X1 Brass bushing - C13-46-
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 NL $ 15.93 $16.28000 $13.50000
T 72 X 2 Brass BUshing - C18-67-
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 NL $ 15.34 $15.67000 $16.00000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 2 X %" Brass Bushing - C18-37-NL| $ 16.60 $16.97000 $16.00000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 20 |2 X 1 Brass Bushing - C18-4/-NL | $ 15.38 $15.72000 $16.00000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |% Brass Street 90 $ 7.95 $10.49000 $8.15000]
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |1 Brass Street 90 $ 13.06 $17.17000 $13.10000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |17 Brass Street 90 $ 26.11 $34.33000]  $26.75000]
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 |2 Brass Street 90 $ 4425 $58.17000 $45.00000]
¥4 Solld Plug Brass C.C. Threads -
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 CSP-3-A-NL $ 6.51 $6.65000 $6.90000




1" Solid Plug Brass C.C. Threads -

Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 10 |CSP-4-A-NL $ 9.48 $9.68000 $10.05000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 30 |[34" Brass 90 $ 6.59 $7.63000 $5.95000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |1 Brass 90 3 10.72 $12.40000 $10.05000]
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 17" Brass 90 $ 21.43 $24.80000 $18.95000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |2 Brass 90 3 34.59 $40.04000 $31.25000]
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |34 Brass Tee $ 8.23 $9.52000 $7.50000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |1 Brass Tee 3 14.84 $17.17000 $13.10000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 1 %" Brass Tee $ 25.54 $29.56000 $22.50000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 |1 % Brass Tee 3 18.84 $33.39000 $25.15000]
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 2" Brass Tee $ 47.79 $55.32000 $42.15000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |% Two Part Union - CS22-33-NL_ | $ 12.43 $12.71000 $13.30000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 1” Two Part Union - CS22-44-NL $ 19.22 $19.64000 $20.60000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 1 %" Two Part Union - CS22-66-NL| $ 50.71 $51.82000 $46.85000
Brass IEittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 2" Two Part Union- CS22-77-NL $ 89.62 $91.59000 $65.00000
Ya Wiale Adapter coupling - Co2-
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 60 |33-G-NL $ 12.55 $12.82000 $13.40000
T Male Adapier Coupling - C84-4%4
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 20 |G-NL $ 14.66 $15.19000 $15.90000
T 72 Male Adapter coupling - Co4-
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 66-G-NL $ 40.72 $41.61000 $43.50000
2" Male Adapter coupling - C84-77
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |G-NL $ 59.34 $60.64000 $63.35000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 50 [¥% Female Coupling $ 5.80 $6.69000 $5.10000]
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 10 |1” Female Coupling - C14-33G-NL | $ 8.70 $11.43000 $8.95000
[Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 |1 % Female Coupling 3 21.43 $24.80000]  $19.10000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |2" Female Coupling $ 35.43 $41.01000 $32.65000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 20 %" Female Adapter - C14-33G-NL | $ 13.20 $13.49000 $14.10000
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 10 |1" Female Adapter - C14-44-G-NL | $ 17.91 $18.31000 $19.15000
Y Brass compression 90% - L44-
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 10 |33G-NL $ 19.76 $20.19000 $21.10000
T Brass Compression 90% - L424-
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 |44G-NL $ 25.38 $25.94000 $27.10000
T Vs Brass compression 90% -
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 5 L44-55G-NL $ 45.68 $46.86000 $48.95000
T 72 Brass Compression 90% -
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 L44-66G-NL $ 81.49 $83.28000 $86.95000
72" Brass compression 90% - L44-
Brass Fittings - (Must Be Lead Free) 2 77G-NL $ 164.89 $169.05000] $175.90000
CUrD Stops & corporation Stops - Fora
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 25 |34” Curb Stop B41-333W-G-NL $ 50.45 $51.56000 $53.85000
Curb stops & Corporation Stops - Ford
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 325 |1" Curb Stop B41-444W-G-NL $ 76.53 $78.21000 $81.70000
CUID Stops & corporation Stops - Fora
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 5 1 %" Curb Stop B41-666W-G-NL | $ 164.41 $168.23000] $175.65000
Curb Stops & Corporation Stops - Ford
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 20 2" Curb Stop B41-777W-G-NL $ 228.19 $233.20000 $243.50000
CUrD Stops & corporation Stops - Fora
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 20 |34 Corp. Stop F1000-3-G-NL $ 27.39 $27.99000 $29.25000
Turb stops & Corporation Stops - Ford
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 325 1" Corp. Stop F1000-4-G-NL $ 41.41 $42.32000 $44.20000
CUrD Stops & corporation Stops - Fora
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 5 1 %" Corp. Stop FB1000-6-G-NL | $ 119.39 $122.01000] $127.40000
Turb stops & Corporation Stops - Ford
Only (Must Be Lead Free) 35 2" Corp. Stop FB1000-7-G-NL $ 197.46 $201.80000 $210.70000
Stamnless steel Repair clamps - Fora Falr Circle Clamp 28 X0 - Fo1-263
Only 5 75 $ 34.25 $35.00000 $46.85000
Stamless Steel Repair clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 4 X
Only 5 12” 0.D. of 4.80 - FS1-480-125 $ 67.47 $68.95000 $92.30000




oingle Fanel Clamp 1or Fipe 4™ X

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford 12" X %" O.D. of 4.80- FSI-480-

Only 5 125CC3 90.93 $92.93000] $124.35000

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 4” X

Only 5 127X 1" O0.D. FS1-480-125-CC4 90.93 $92.93000] $124.35000

Stainless Steel Repalr Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 4 X

Only 5 20" O.D. -FS1-480-20 119.13 $121.75000 $162.90000

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for PIpe 4 X

Only 2 20" X 17 O.D. 0 FS1-48020-CC3 142.59 $145.73000]  $195.00000

Stainless Steel Repalr Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp Tor Pipe 6. X

Only 75 12" O.D. - FS1-724-125 81.10 $82.88000 $110.90000

Staniess Steel Repair clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp 10r PIpe 6. X

Only 5 12" X %" O.D. FS1-725-CC3 104.56 $106.85000] $143.00000
Single Panel Clamp for PIpe 6. X

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford 12" X 1" O.D. of 6.90 - FSI-724-

Only 20 |cc4 104.56 $106.85000] $143.00000

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 6” X

Only 2 12" X1 %" 0.D. - FS1-724-CC6 111.38 $113.83000] $152.35000

[Stamnless steel Repair cramps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for PIpe 6 X

Only 5 12" X 2" O.D. FS1-724-CC7 118.67 $121.27000] $162.30000

Stainless Steel Repalr Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp Tor Pipe 6. X

Only 35 20" O.D. FS1-724-20 147.70 $150.95000 $202.00000

[Stamless steel Repair cramps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for PIpe 6 X

Only 5 20" X% FS1-724-20-CC3 171.17 $174.93000] $234.10000

Stainless Steel Repalr Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp Tor Pipe 6 X

Only 10 |20” X 1" O.D. FS1-724-CC4 171.17 $174.93000] $234.10000

[Stamnless steel Repair cramps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for PIpe 8 X

Only 100 |12"O.D .FS1-939-125 95.36 $97.45000 $130.45000
Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 8 X

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford 12” X %" for O.D. FS1-939-125-

Only 2 CC3 118.82 $121.43000] $162.50000

Stainless Steel Repalr Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp Tor Pipe 8 X

Only 10 12” X 1" O.D. FS1-939-125-CC4 118.82 $121.43000 $162.50000

Staniess Steel Repair clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp 1or PIpe 8- X

Only 5 12" X 2" O.D. FSI-939-125-CC7 132.93 $135.85000] $181.80000

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp Tor Pipe 8 X

Only 50 20" O.D. FS1-939--20 159.59 $163.09000 $218.25000

Stainiess Steel Repair clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp 1or PIpe 8- X

Only 2 20" X %" 0.D.FS1-939-20-CC3 183.04 $187.06000] $250.30000

Stainless Steel Repalr Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp Tor Pipe 8 X

Only 10 |20” X 1" O.D. FS1-939-20-CC4 183.04 $187.06000 $250.30000

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for PIpe 8 X

Only 2 20" X1 %" 0.D.FS1-939-CC6 189.47 $194.04000] $259.65000

Stainless Steel Repalr Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 12" X

Only 20 12" 0.D FS1-1350-125 148.97 $152.24000 $203.75000

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 12" X

Only 2 12" X %” O.D FS1-1350-125-CC3. 172.43 $176.22000 $235.80000

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 12" X

Only 5 12" X 1" O.D. FS1-1350-125-CC4 172.43 $176.22000] $235.80000

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 12" X

Only 2 127 X1 %" FS1-1350-125-CC6 179.46 $183.20000] $245.15000

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 12" X

Only 2 12" X 2" 0.D. FS1-1350-125-CC7 186.53 $190.63000] $255.10000

Stainless steel Repair cramps - Fora Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 12" X

Only 20 |20" O.D. FS1-1350-20 234.69 $239.84000] $320.95000

Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 12" X

Only 2 20" X %" 0.D. FS1-1350-20-CC4 258.14 $263.81000] $353.05000




Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 12" X

Only 10 |20” X 1" O.D. FS1-1350-20-CC4 258.14 $263.81000] $353.05000
Stainless Steel Repalr Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp Tor Pipe 12" X

Only 5 20" X 1 %" FS1-1350-20-CC6 264.97 $270.79000] $362.35000
Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - Ford Single Panel Clamp for Pipe 12" X

Only 1 20” X 2" O.D. FS1-1350-20-CC7 272.25 $278.23000 $372.30000
Stalnless Steel Repalr Clamps - 10" X197 2bZ oSS CLAMP

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 1 SMITH BLAIR ONLY - $329.76000 $274.80000
Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - 10" X 207 ZbZ 5SS CLAMF SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 3 BLAIR ONLY - $439.10000 $369.75000
Stalnless Steel Repalr Clamps - 10" X 30" ZbZ 55 CLAMF SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 3 BLAIR ONLY - $690.04000] $563.30000
Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - 16" X 127 265 5SS CLAMP SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 1 BLAIR ONLY - $337.64000 $278.40000
[Stamless steel Repair cramps - T8 X 1D 203 oS CLAMP. SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 1 BLAIR ONLY - $486.64000] $401.35000
Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - 16" X 30" 265 5o CLAMFP  SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 1 BLAIR ONLY - $999.13000 $800.00000
[Stamnless steel Repair cramps - 20" X 15 263 5SS CLAMP. SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 1 BLAIR ONLY - $551.24000 $441.00000
Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - 207 X 207 265 55 CLAMP SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 1 BLAIR ONLY - $732.11000 $585.75000
[Stamless steel Repair cramps - 20" X 30" 263 SS CLAMP. SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 1 BLAIR ONLY - $1,119.71000] $900.00000
Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - 247 X197 265 5o CLAMFP  SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 1 BLAIR ONLY - $861.31000 $690.00000
[Stamnless steel Repair cramps - 24" X 20" 263 SS CLAMP. SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 2 BLAIR ONLY - $1,171.40000 $940.00000
Stainless Steel Repair Clamps - 247 X 307 265 55 CLAMP  SMITH

SMITH/BLAIR ONLY 2 BLAIR ONLY - $1,757.09000] $1,410.65000
All-3T7 Series Double Strap Epoxy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 5 4” X %" Tapping Saddle 59.37 $48.90000 $41.60000
All- 317 SEeries Double Strap EpPOXy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 2 6” X %" Service Saddle 68.92 $56.19000 $47.55000
All- 317 Series Double Strap Epoxy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 125 |6” X 1” Service Saddle 68.92 $56.19000 $47.55000
All-3T7 Series Double Strap Epoxy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 2 6” X 2” Tapping Saddle 74.39 $67.35000 $57.30000
All-3T7 Series Double Strap Epoxy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 5 8" X %" Tapping Saddle 79.02 $66.39000 $56.50000
All- 317 Series Double Strap EpPOXy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 75 |8” X 1" Tapping Saddle 79.02 $66.39000 $56.50000
All- 317 Series Double Strap EPOXy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 2 8" X 1 V%" Tapping Saddle 85.00 $71.85000 $60.50000
All-3T7 Series Double Strap Epoxy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 15 |8" X 2" Tapping Saddle 85.00 $78.39000 $66.00000
All-3T7 Series Double Strap Epoxy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 50 [|12” X 1” Tapping Saddle 99.26 $91.84000 $81.95000
All-3T7 Series Double Strap Epoxy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 2 12” X 1 %" Tapping Saddle 111.71 $98.35000 $81.10000
All- 317 Series Double Strap EpPOXy

Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 5 12” X 2" Tapping Saddle 111.71 $105.21000 $87.25000




All-3T7 Series Double Strap Epoxy
Coated C. C Threads (Ford Or

Smith/Blair Only) 2 24” X 2” Tapping Saddle 199.60 $179.58000] $191.00000
Meter Connections (Ford only) (Must Be %" Meter Loops with Dual Checks
Lead Free) 300 |- VHH72-9W-11-33-NL 140.80 $143.23000] $149.55000
Meter Connections (Ford only) (Must Be 1" Meter Loops with Dual Checks
Lead Free) 50 |VHH74-12W-11-44-NL 215.37 $220.11000 $229.80000
[Meter Connections (Ford only) (Must Be B8 X 7= Meter Riser (/" Riser)
Lead Free) 50 |V42-7W-NL 77.63 $79.34000] $108.00000
Meter Connections (Ford only) (MUSt Be ¥4 Ford Meter Loop NUts -
Lead Free) 250 JCSSUN1-33-NL 7.30 $7.46000 $7.75000
[Meter Connections (Ford only) (MUSt Be T Ford Meter Loop NUts -
Lead Free) 25 JCSSUN1-34-NL 14.04 $14.35000 $14.85000
Meter Connections (Ford only) (Must Be Y Angle Stops for Meter Loops -
Lead Free) 25 |KV13-332W -NL 26.35 $26.93000 $27.85000
Meter Connections (Ford only) (MUSt Be T Angle Stops for Meter Loops
Lead Free) 10 |KV13444W -NL 40.40 $41.28000 $42.65000
Meter Connections (Ford only) (Must Be Z Flanged Rey Meter valve
Lead Free) 15 [|Part # FV 13777W-NL 178.32 $182.24000] $188.20000
Meter Connections (Ford only) (MUSt Be Z° Meter Flange coupling
Lead Free) 15 |Part # LF3177/90-NL 99.29 $101.47000] $104.80000
Meter Connections (Ford only) (Must Be 1 1/2" Meter Flanged Coupling
Lead Free) 15 |Part #LF3166/90 -NL 67.26 $68.74000 $71.00000
Meter Connections (Ford only) (Must Be 1 1/2" Flanged Key Meter Valve
Lead Free) 15 [|Part # FV13666W-NL 128.33 $131.15000] $135.50000
AITFIUNgsS with Mega Lug Style, 6 X 12 MJ Sold Sleeves w/ Mega
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 15 |Lug Style and Acc. Pack 157.94 $191.91000] $169.85000
AT FITUNgs with Mega Lug Style, 8" X 12 MJ Solid Sleeve w/ Mega
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 15 |Lug and Acc. Pack 206.70 $254.68000] $225.35000
AITFIUNgS with Mega Lug Style, 12 X 127 MJ Sold Sleeve wl Mega
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 10 |Lug and Acc. Pack 402.80 $490.33000]  $433.50000
16” X 15” C153 DI MJ Solid Sleeve
All Fittings with Mega Lug Style, w/ Mega Lug and Acc. Pack -
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 2 Domestic preferred if available 898.00 $1,113.81000] $973.15000
20” X 15" C153 DI MJ Solid Sleeve
All Fittings with Mega Lug Style, w/ Mega Lug and Acc. Pack
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 2 Domestic preferred if available 1,431.00 $1,785.94000] $1,508.25000
24” X 15” C153 DI MJ Solid Sleeve
All Fittings with Mega Lug Style, w/ Mega Lug and Acc. Pack
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 5 Domestic preferred if available 1,988.56 $2,252.53000] $1,938.95000
47 Mega Lug W/ Bolts and Gaskets
4" Mega Lug w/ Bolts and Gaskets 2 PVC PIPE 30.00 $35.08000 $31.25000
6" Mega Lug W/ BOIts and Gaskets
6" Mega Lug w/ Bolts and Gaskets 25 |- PVC PIPE 38.00 $44.36000 $39.50000
8 Mega Lug w/ Bolts and Gaskets
8” Mega Lug w/ Bolts and Gaskets 25 |PVC PIPE 51.00 $59.90000 $53.10000
12 Mega Lug w/ Bolts and
12" Mega Lug w/ Bolts and Gaskets 10 |Gaskets - PVC PIPE 92.00 $108.66000 $95.95000
16, Mega Lug w/ Bolts and Gasket
16” Mega Lug w/ Bolts and Gasket 2 - PVC PIPE 181.00 $213.63000] $188.50000
18" Mega Cug W/ Bolts and Gasket
18" Mega Lug w/ Bolts and Gasket 5 - PVC PIPE 215.00 $258.08000] $226.50000
20" Mega Lug W/ BOIts and Gasket
20" Mega Lug w/ Bolts and Gasket 5 - PVC PIPE 268.00 $342.53000] $283.20000
247 Mega Lug wi Bolts and Gasket
24” Mega Lug w/ Bolts and Gasket 5 - PVC PIPE 310.00 $366.58000] $323.05000
G Retamner Gland (Sold) ron & PVC 6 Retainer Gland (Sohad) Ton &
Style 2 PVC Style 12.00 $58.00000 $10.35000




o Retaliner Gland (Solid) Iron & PVC

o Retainer Gland (Solid) Iron &

Style 2 PVC Style $ 15.00 $60.00000 $12.45000
177 Retainer Gland (Solid) Iron & PVC 177 Retainer Gland (Solid) Iron &
Style 2 PVC Style $ 25.00 $100.00000 $19.15000
6" Retainer Gland (Split) 2 |6 Retainer Gland (Split) 3 12.00 $18.00000 $10.35000]
8" Retainer Gland (Split) 2 8" Retainer Gland (Split) $ 15.00 $22.00000 $12.45000
12" Retainer Gland (Split) 2 |12" Retainer Gland (Split) $ 25.00 $36.00000 $20.50000]
ATFtngs with Mega Lug Style, Z7Cut In Sleeve w/ Mega Lug and
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 2 JAcc. Pack $ 433.54 $516.08000]  $400.85000
AT FItiings with Mega Lug Style, 6 Cut In Sleeve W/ Mega Lug and
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 2 Acc. Pack $ 575.42 $685.43000] $562.95000
ATFtngs with Mega Lug Style, 8™ Cut In Sleeve W/ Mega Lug and
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 2 JAcc. Pack $ 746.24 $889.46000] $728.50000
AT FIttings with Mega Lug Style, 17" Cut In Sleeve W/ Mega Lug
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 2 and Acc. Pack $ 1,272.00 $1,463.91000] $1,171.85000
AT Fittings with Mega Lug Style, 6" Anchor Coupling w/ Mega Lug
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 5 and Acc. Pack $ 165.36 $189.80000] $165.25000
AT FIimgs with Mega Lug Style, T X 22 72° Bend (MJ) W/ Mega
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 5 Lug and Acc. Pack $ 138.86 $182.16000] $156.85000
ATFings with Mega Lug Style, T2 X 22 72° Bend (MJ) W/ Mega
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 2 Lug and Acc. Pack $ 445.20 $526.08000] $447.25000
AT Fiings with Mega Lug Style, 27X 45° Bend (MJ) W/ Mega Lug
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 2 and Acc. Pack $ 107.06 $135.96000] $118.50000
AT Fittings with Mega Lug Style, 6 X 45° Bend (MJ) W/ Mega Lug
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 5 and Acc. Pack $ 140.98 $191.10000] $163.50000
AT Fiings with Mega Lug Style, 8" X 45° Bend (MJ) W/ Mega Lug
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 5 and Acc. Pack $ 206.70 $265.24000] $228.10000
AT Fings with Mega Lug Style, T2 X 45° Bend (MJ) W/ Mega Lug
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 2 and Acc. Pack $ 477.00 $581.33000] $498.50000
AT Fiings with Mega Lug Style, B X 00 Bend (MJ) W/ Mega Lug
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 2 and Acc. Pack $ 169.60 $213.04000] $174.65000
6 X6 Stainless Steel Tapping
Sleeve Including Stainless Steel
Stainless Steel Bolts 3 Bolt Sets $ 537.05 $508.16000] $423.50000
B™X 6" Stamnless steel Tapping
Sleeve Including Stainless Steel
Stainless Steel Bolts 3 Bolt Sets $ 577.70 $561.90000] $475.65000
B™X 8" otamnless steel Tapping
Sleeve Including Stainless Steel
Stainless Steel Bolts 2 Bolt Sets $ 706.58 $712.40000] $596.75000
12" X 6 Stamnless steel 1apping
Sleeve Including Stainless Steel
Stainless Steel Bolts 2 Bolt Sets $ 655.08 $700.78000] $590.10000
T2 X 8" Stamnless steel 1apping
Sleeve Including Stainless Steel
Stainless Steel Bolts 2 Bolt Sets $ 897.48 $879.21000] $740.35000
TZ27 X 1727 Stainless Steel Tapping
Sleeve Including Stainless Steel
Stainless Steel Bolts 2 Bolt Sets $ 1,348.71 $1,293.38000] $1,089.15000
All Fittings with Mega Lug Style, 8" X 6" MJ Reducers (Ductile Iron)
Accessory Pack 2 |w/ Mega Lug and Acc. Pack $ 196.10 $223.70000]  $192.50000
Al FITiNgs with Mega Lug Style, G X0 1€€ MJ X FL (DUctle fron)
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ w/ Mega Lug Bolts & Flange
Stainless Steel Bolts 10 |Gasket $ 238.50 $305.60000] $251.05000
Al FITiNgs with Mega Lug Style, 8 X0 T€e MJ X FL (Ductie Iron)
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ w/ Mega Lug Bolts & Flange
Stainless Steel Bolts 10 |Gasket $ 312.70 $388.68000] $319.65000
AT FItmgs with Mega Lug Style, 8™X 8" Tee MJ X FL (Ducule Tron)
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ w/ Mega Lug Bolts & Flange
Stainless Steel Bolts 5 Gasket $ 397.50 $500.86000] $413.15000
AT Fitings with Mega Lug Style, T2 X6 Tee MJ X FL (Ductile Iron)
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ w/ Mega Lug Bolts & Flange
Stainless Steel Bolts 5 Gasket $ 540.60 $692.39000] $545.95000




AT FITUNgS with Mega Lug Style,
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/

TZ" X 8" 1ee MJ X FL (Ductile Tron)
w/ Mega Lug Bolts & Flange

Stainless Steel Bolts 5 Gasket $ 625.40 $760.08000] $632.35000
All Fitungs with Mega Lug Style, 127 X127 Tee MJ X FL (Ductile
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ Iron) w/ Mega Lug Bolts & Flange
Stainless Steel Bolts 5 Gasket $ 795.00 $974.20000] $781.75000
AT FITings with Mega Lug Style,
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ 6” X 6” Tee MJ (Ductile Iron) w/
Stainless Steel Bolts 5 Mega Lug Bolts and Gasket $ 259.70 $312.65000] $271.30000
AT FIings with Mega Lug Style,
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ 8" X 6" Tee MJ (Ductile Iron) w/
Stainless Steel Bolts 5 Mega Lug Bolts and Gasket $ 424.00 $389.23000] $337.80000
Al FITINgs with Mega Lug Style,
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ 8" X 8" Tee MJ (Ductile Iron) w/
Stainless Steel Bolts 10 |Mega Lug Bolts and Gasket $ 355.10 $447.01000] $385.50000
AT Fiings with Mega Lug Style,
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ 12" X 6" Tee MJ (Ductile Iron) w/
Stainless Steel Bolts 5 Mega Lug Bolts and Gaskets $ 614.80 $684.19000] $557.50000
AT FITings with Mega Lug Style,
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ 12" X 8" Tee MJ (Ductile Iron) w/
Stainless Steel Bolts 5 Mega Lug Bolts and Gaskets $ 636.00 $724.10000] $614.65000
AT Fitings with Mega Lug Style,
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket w/ 12" X 12" Tee MJ (Ductile Iron) w/
Stainless Steel Bolts 5 Mega Lug Bolts and Gaskets $ 742.00 $915.05000] $767.85000
T Blind Flange w/ Stainless
Stainless Steel Bolt Kit and Gasket 2 Steel Bolt Kit and Gasket $ 106.00 $117.75000 $98.20000
8" BIINd Flange W/ Stainless
Stainless Steel Bolt Kit and Gasket 2 Steel Bolt Kit and Gasket $ 137.80 $169.00000 $139.15000
7" BIINd Flange wistainiess
Stainless Steel Bolt Kit and Gasket 2 Steel Bolt Kit and Gasket $ 265.00 $321.50000] $262.80000
AT Fittings with Mega Lug Style, 6" MJ Caps W/ Mega Lug Bolts and
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 15 |Gaskets $ 79.50 $93.93000 $81.25000
AT FIiings with Mega Lug Style, 8" MJ Caps W/ Mega Lug Bolts and
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 15 |Gaskets $ 111.30 $137.90000] $118.50000
AT Fittings with Mega Lug Style, T2 MJ Caps W/ Mega Lug Bolts
Accessory Pack and Flange Gasket 5 Jand Gaskets $ 169.60 $254.10000] $217.30000
Accessory Pack / Bolts and Gaskets 10 |6 Solid Plug MJ $ 79.50 $99.13000 $83.90000
Accessory Pack / Bolts and Gaskets 20 |8" Solid Plug MJ $ 106.00 $134.06000] $112.85000
Accessory Pack / Bolts and Gaskets 10 |12 Solid Plug MJ $ 159.00 $201.50000]  $169.65000
Accessory Pack / Bolts and Gaskets 2 |6 Solid Plug with 2" Tap 3 100.70 $130.00000]  $110.05000)
Accessory Pack / Bolts and Gaskets 2 |8 Solid Plug with 2" Tap 3 131.44 $164.13000]  $139.05000
Accessory Pack / Bolts and Gaskets 2 [12" Solid Plug with 2" Tap 3 212.00 $232.38000]  $194.65000)
8 Millimeter Thickness Rolls of Polyrap in 8 Millimeter Thickness Rolls of
"SHEET ROLLS" ONLY 5 Polyrap in "SHEET ROLLS" ONLY | $ - $68.67000 $80.15000
" Valve Operatng stem
4’ Valve Operating Stem Extensions 5 Extensions $ 45.00 $56.00000 $41.15000
7 Valve Operating Stem
7' Valve Operating Stem Extensions 2 Extensions $ 50.00 $73.33000 $51.30000
Stainless Steel Bolt & Nut Set for Flange Stainless Steel Bolt & Nut Set for
Fittings 6 Set 34" X 3 ¥4~ 15 |Flange Fittings 6 Set %" X 3 14" $ 17.00 $23.33000 $18.50000
Stainless Steel Bolt & Nut Set for Flange Stainless Steel Bolt & Nut Set for
Fittings 8 Set 34" X 3 %" 15 |Flange Fittings 8 Set %" X 3 %" $ 20.00 $26.00000 $20.50000
Stainless Steel Bolt & Nut Set for Flange Stainless Steel Bolt & Nut Set for
Fittings 12 Set 7/8” X 4" 2 Flange Fittings 12 Set 7/8” X 4" $ 35.00 $58.67000 $43.00000
T —bolts 3/4",5%." ,6”, 7 5 T—bolts 3/4"5 % , 6, 7 $ 5.00 $7.00000 $4.50000
[~ ACCessory Pack MJ (Bolts and " ACCessory Pack MJ (Bolts and
Gasket) 5 Gasket) $ 10.00 $21.13000 $18.35000
6~ Accessory Pack MJ (Bolts and 6~ Accessory Pack MJ (Bolts and
Gasket) 10 |Gasket) $ 12.00 $24.38000 $21.15000
8" ACCessory Pack MJ (Bolts and 8 ACCessory Pack MJ (Bolts and
Gasket) 10 |Gasket) $ 15.00 $27.63000 $24.05000




T2 ACCEssory Pack MJ (Bolts and

TZ ACCESSOry Pack MJ (Bolts and

Gasket) 5 Gasket) $ 18.00 $38.19000 $33.20000
1/6” Thick Roll of Red Gasket
1/8” Thick Roll of Red Gasket Material 5 Material $ - $590.83000] $125.00000
24” Rubber MJ Gland Gasket 2 24” Rubber MJ Gland Gasket $ 35.00 $27.96000 $26.00000
4" Transition Gaskets 5 |4" Transition Gaskets $ 7.00 $8.36000 $6.50000
6" Transition Gaskets 5 |6" Transition Gaskets 3 8.00 $9.29000 $7.25000]
8" Transition Gaskets 5 8" Transition Gaskets $ 12.00 $13.93000 $10.85000
6" Flange Gaskets 2 |6 Flange Gaskets $ 5.00 $2.03000 $2.50000)
8" Flange Gaskets 2 8" Flange Gaskets $ 5.00 $2.54000 $3.50000
8" Flange Gaskets 2 |8 Flange Gaskets 3 5.00 $2.54000 $3.50000]
Gate Valves & Fire Hydranis (MUueller, I~ MJ X FL Gate valve W/ Mega
Waterous, Kennedy, American-Darling, Lug w/ Acc. and Flange Gasket
Clow, J&S- VALVES ONLY) 2 and Bolts $ 400.00 $398.00000 $383.45000
Gate Valves & Fire Hydranis (Mueller, 6" MJ X FL Gate valve W/ Mega
Waterous, Kennedy, American-Darling, Lug w/ Acc. and Flange Gasket
Clow, J&S- VALVES ONLY) 14 |and Bolts $ 510.00 $532.00000 $500.80000
Gaie Valves & Fire Hydranis (Mueller, 8" MJ X FL Gaie valve w/ Mega
Waterous, Kennedy, American-Darling, Lug w/ Acc. and Flange Gasket
Clow, J&S- VALVES ONLY) 10 |and Bolts $ 775.00 $825.00000 $765.20000
Gate valves & Firte Hyarans (Muerer, 12" MJ X FL Gate valve w/ Mega
Waterous, Kennedy, American-Darling, Lug w/ Acc. and Flange Gasket
Clow, J&S- VALVES ONLY) 5 and Bolts $ 1,450.00 $1,559.00000] $1,470.35000
Gate Valves & Fire Hydranis (Mueller,
Waterous, Kennedy, American-Darling, 4" MJ x MJ Gate Valve w/ Mega
Clow, J&S- VALVES ONLY) 2 Lug w/ Acc. $ 400.00 $435.00000 $423.00000
Gate Valves & Fire Hydranis (Mueller,
Waterous, Kennedy, American-Darling, 6" MJ X MJ Gate Valve w/ Mega
Clow, J&S- VALVES ONLY) 10 |Lug w/ Acc. $ 510.00 $553.00000 $538.95000
Gate Valves & Fire Hydranis (Mueller,
Waterous, Kennedy, American-Darling, 8" MJ X MJ Gate Valve w/ Mega
Clow, J&S- VALVES ONLY) 14 Lug w/ Acc. $ 775.00 $859.00000 $830.95000
Gate valves & Fire Hyarans (Muerer,
Waterous, Kennedy, American-Darling, 12" MJ X MJ Gate Valve w/ Mega
Clow, J&S- VALVES ONLY) 5 Lug w/ Acc. $ 1,475.00 $1,675.00000] $1,606.65000
Clow Meaallion FH with Retaining
Clow Medallion FH with Retaining Gland Gland Pack (Mega Lug Type) 5’
Pack (Mega Lug Type) 5’ Bury 1 |Bury $ 1,750.00 $1,950.00000| $1,950.00000
Clow Fire Hydrant Repair Kit 5 Clow Fire Hydrant Repair Kit $ 100.00 $120.96000] $104.05000
Clow 6” Fire Hydrant Extension Kit 5 Clow 6” Fire Hydrant Extension Kit | $ 215.00 $306.24000] $221.85000
Clow T Ft. Fire Hydrant Exiension
Clow 1 Ft. Fire Hydrant Extension Kit 2 Kit $ 250.00 $361.92000 $259.45000
Clow 2 Ft. Fire Hydrant Exiension
Clow 2 Ft. Fire Hydrant Extension Kit 2 Kit $ 325.00 $464.00000] $334.35000
Rennedy "Guardian. Fire Hydrant Repair KRennedy "Guardian. Fire Hydrant
Kits 2 Repair Kits $ 100.00 $115.20000 $99.15000
[Rennedy "Guardian’ 6 Fire Hydrant Rennedy "Guardian 6 Fire
Extension Kits 2 Hydrant Extension Kits $ 200.00 $278.40000]  $199.50000
KRennedy "Guardian® 1 Ft. Fire Hydrant KRennedy "Guardian® 1 Ft. Fire
Extension Kits 2 Hydrant Extension Kits $ 225.00 $317.84000] $230.25000
Rennedy "Guardian. 2 Ft. Fire Hydrant Rennedy "Guardian 2 Ft. Fire
Extension Kits 2 Hydrant Extension Kits $ 300.00 $403.68000] $292.45000
M & H Dresser Model # 919 & 929  Fire M & H Dresser Model # 919 & 929
Hydrant Repair Kits 2 Fire Hydrant Repair Kits $ 125.00 $139.20000] $119.75000
M & H Dresser Model #919 & 929 1 Ft. M & H Dresser Model #919 & 929
Fire Hydrant Extension Kits 2 1 Ft. Fire Hydrant Extension Kits | $ 225.00 $317.84000] $235.25000
M & H Dresser Model #919 & 929 2 Ft. M & H Dresser Model #919 & 929
Fire Hydrant Extension Kits 2 2 Ft. Fire Hydrant Extension Kits | $ 300.00 $403.68000] $298.85000
Waterous Fire Hydrant Repair Kits 30 |Waterous Fire Hydrant Repair Kits | $ 95.00 $109.48000 $92.85000
Waterous 6 Fire Hydrant
Waterous 6” Fire Hydrant Extension Kits 2 Extension Kits $ 200.00 $216.64000] $200.95000




Waterous 1 Ft. Fire Hydrant Extension

Waterous 1 Ft. Fire Hydrant

Kits 2 Extension Kits $ 225.00 $255.06000]  $230.25000
Waterous 2 FL. Fire Hydrant Exiension Waterous 2 Ft. Fire Hydrant
Kits 2 Extension Kits $ 290.00 $334.90000 $297.50000
Mueller Fire Hydrant Repair Kits 75 [Mueller Fire Hydrant Repair Kits | $ 105.00 $150.00000]  $101.85000
Mueller L 1t. Fire Hydrant
Mueller 1 ft. Fire Hydrant Extension Kit 5 Extension Kit $ 270.00 $337.50000] $265.50000
MUeTer 2 1t. Fire Hyarant
Mueller 2 ft. Fire Hydrant Extension Kit 2 Extension Kit $ 350.00 $443.75000] $340.45000
Neoprene Rubber Seats for Clow Neoprene Rubber Seats for Clow
(Medallion) 5 ](Medallion) $ 50.00 $74.49000 $46.50000
Neoprene RUDDEr Seats Tor Waterous Neoprene RUDDEr Seats Tor
(Pacer) 5 |waterous (Pacer) $ 95.00 $86.86000 $86.75000
Neoprene Rubber Seats for Mueler Neoprene Rubber Seats for
(Improved & Centurion) 25  |Mueller (Improved & Centurion) $ 95.00 $188.74000 $46.50000
[Neoprene Rubber seats 1or Renneady Neoprene RUbDer Seats Tor
(Guardian) 2 Kennedy (Guardian) $ 50.00 $168.77000 $63.25000
Neoprene Rubber Seats for M & H Neoprene Rubber Seats for M & H
Dresser (919 & 929) 2 Dresser (919 & 929) $ 65.00 $70.71000 $43.75000
Clow Operating Nut Tnrust
Clow Operating Nut Thrust Bearings 5 Bearings $ 7.00 $1.89000 $6.00000
Mueller Friction Rings 5 |Mueller Friction Rings $ 3.00 $2.81000 $2.25000
Shorty Cast Iron Valve Box 75 |Shorty Cast Iron Valve Box 3 65.00 $71.85000 $65.65000]
24" Valve Stack 10 ]24" Valve Stack $ 100.00 $107.66000 $97.35000
36" Valve Stack 5 |36 Valve Stack $ 125.00 $136.25000]  $122.50000
Valve Box Lids Only 5 [Valve Box Lids Only $ 22.00 $22.35000 $21.50000
Shorty Stack Valve Lid 15 |Shorty Stack Valve Lid 3 20.00 $20.72000 $19.25000]
2 1/2" Valve Stack Extensions 25 |2 1/2" Valve Stack Extensions $ 33.00 $34.71000 $31.00000
Small PVC Meter Can 18 X 12
Small PVC Meter Can 18” x 14” (No Lid) 250 |(No Lid) BH-P34P14D $ 75.00 $79.93000 $73.05000
Carge PVC Meter Can 24" X 18
Large PVC Meter Can 24” x 18" (No Lid) 50 |(No Lid) BH-P548P $ 165.00 $174.45000 $158.50000
PVC Meter Can 28° X 18 (No Lid)
PVC Meter Can 28” x 18” (No Lid) BH 25 |BH $ 185.00 $197.06000 $178.20000
Carge( Galvanized) bbA Meter Can Carge( Galvanized) bbA Meter Can
24” x 18” (No Lid) 25 ]|24” x18” (No Lid) $ 175.00 $187.62000 $169.65000
Small (Galvanized) 34A Meter can Small (Galvanized) a4A Meter can
18” x 14” (No Lid) 25 18" x14” (No Lid) $ 75.00 $79.73000 $73.65000
#34A Cover (12" Iid) only 25 |#34A Cover (12 1id) only 3 30.00 $31.36000 $28.85000
[#55A Cover (20" lid) only 25 |#55A Cover (20" lid) only 3 105.00 $116.09000]  $104.95000]
Water Meter Manhole Lid & Ring
Water Meter Manhole Lid & Ring Only 5 Only $ 515.00 $551.52000] $496.05000
Type Soft Copper 750 (60 Ft. rolls) 3/4" Copper Tubing $ 6.25 $3.24000 $3.10000
[Type Soft Copper 7500 [(60 Ft. rolls) 1" Copper Tubing $ 7.00 $4.40000 $4.05000
Type Soft Copper 100 |(60 Ft. rolls) 1 1/2" Copper Tubing | $ 9.50 $6.20000 $6.30000
[Type Soft Copper 600 |(60 Ft. rolls) 2" Copper Tubing $ 13.50 $11.95000 $10.05000
Type Soft Copper 100 [3/4" Quest Tubing $ - $0.29000 $0.42000
[Type Soft Copper 100 |1" Quest Tubing 3 - $0.49000 $0.82000
Miscellaneous Water 12 |HTH Chlorine 5lb $ 20.00 $17.00000 $13.50000
Miscellaneous Water 10 |Pipe Lube - Blue Quart Size $ 11.00 $9.08000 $6.50000
PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |4” X 3" PVC CT Adaptor $ - $4.72000 $3.85000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |4 X3 PVC Coupling $ - $5.33000 $3.10000
PVC Sewer Fittings 5 ]4" Coupling Bell X Bell $ - $9.77000 $8.10000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 10 |4" 22.5 Bends Bell X Bell $ - $7.91000 $6.50000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 10 ]4" 45 Bend Bell X Bell $ - $7.91000 $6.50000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |4 90 Bends Bell X Bell 3 - $9.96000 $8.15000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 15 4" 22.5 Bends Bell X Spicket $ - $7.52000 $6.25000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 12 |4" 45 Bend Bell X Spicket 3 - $7.12000 $6.10000
PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |6” Coupling Bell X Bell $ - $19.52000 $15.75000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 6" 22.5 Bend Bell X Bell $ - $15.57000 $12.85000]




[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |6 45 Bend Bell X Bell 3 $16.07000]  $13.50000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 10 ]6” 90 Bend Bell X Bell $ $18.32000 $14.90000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 10 |6 22.5 Bend Bell X Spigot 3 $14.77000 $12.15000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 2 6" 45 Bend Bell X Spigot $ $14.23000 $12.10000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |8 Coupling Bell X Bell 3 $33.16000 $25.65000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 2 8” 45 Bends Bell X Bell $ $45.41000 $36.20000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |12 Coupling Bell X Bell 3 $106.95000 $85.25000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 2 12” GPK Coupling $ $133.33000 $85.25000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 [10° 90 Bend 3 $170.40000] $132.65000
PVC Sewer Fittings 2 127 22.5 Bend $ $161.91000 $128.95000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |12 90 Bend 3 $220.53000]  $172.45000
PVC Sewer Fittings 2 15”90 Bend $ $465.49000 $355.15000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 5 |4 PVC Caps 3 $5.11000 $4.25000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 5 4" PVC Wye $ $13.64000 $11.00000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 5 |6° PVC Wye $ $31.33000 $25.50000]
PVC Sewer IEittings 2 12" X 4" T-Wye $ $193.63000 $150.20000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 5 |6 X6 SDR-35 Tee $ $27.47000 $22.85000]
PVC Sewer IEittings 5 8" X4” SDR - 35 Tee $ $41.51000 $34.25000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 5 |8 X6 SDR-235 Tee $ $42.95000 $35.65000]
PVC Sewer IEittings 5 8" X 8" SDR — 35 Tee $ $60.95000 $49.20000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |10 X4 SDR-235 Tee 3 $134.87000]  $106.85000
PVC Sewer IEittings 2 8" X4” Wye SDR - 35 $ $41.28000 $33.50000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |8 X6 Wye SDR - 35 $ $49.23000 $39.25000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 10 |4" PVC Tee Wye $ $15.23000 $12.85000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 5 [6° PVC Tee Wye $ $38.44000 $31.20000
PVC Sewer Fittings 5 |6 X4 SDR- 35 Tee Wye $ $32.96000 $26.75000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 5 |8 X4 SDR - 35 Tee Wye 3 $41.75000 $35.25000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 5 8" X 6” SDR — 35 Tee Wye $ $48.01000 $38.30000
" Lateral Cleanout w/ Lid (Cast
PVC Sewer Fittings 20 |iron) $ $60.00000 $46.15000
PVC Sewer Fittings 20 |4" PVC Cleanouts with lids 3 $5.48000 $8.65000]
[PVC Sewer Fittings 20 |4" PVC Lateral Cleanouts W/ Lid | $ $18.67000 $25.50000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 5 |4 PVC Lids and Bolts Only 3 $18.67000 $10.50000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |8 X4 PVC Saddle $ $50.91000 $42.10000
PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |8 X6 PVC Saddle $ $58.31000]  $46.35000]
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |10 X4 PVC Saddle $ $89.99000 $70.20000]
PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |10 X6 PVC Saddle $ $107.44000 $83.25000
PVC Sewer Fittings 2 15" X 4” PVC Saddle $ $118.01000 $92.50000
[PVC Sewer Fittings 2 |10 PVCto 8 PVC Bell 3 $113.29000]  $19.25000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |4" Adapter (Clay-Clay) $ $4.73000 $3.85000
Miscellaneous Sewer 100 |4" Adapter (Clay-lron) 3 $4.39000 $3.65000
Miscellaneous Sewer 100 [4" Adapter (Iron-Iron) $ $4.39000 $3.65000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |6 Adapter (Clay-Clay) 3 $10.13000 $8.25000
Miscellaneous Sewer 30 |6" Adapter (Clay-Iron) $ $9.37000 $7.95000
Miscellaneous Sewer 15 |6" Adapter (Iron-Iron) 3 $9.37000 $7.95000]
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 8" Adapter (Clay-Clay) $ $15.57000 $12.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 10 |8" Adapter (Clay-Iron) 3 $14.43000 $11.45000
Miscellaneous Sewer 10 |8" Adapter (Iron-Iron) $ $14.43000 $11.45000
Miscellaneous Sewer 5 [10° Adapter (Clay-lron) 3 $21.65000 $18.15000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 10” Adapter (Iron-Iron) $ $21.65000 $18.15000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 12” Adapter (Clay-Clay) $ $25.28000 $20.20000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 12” Adapter (Clay-Iron) $ $25.27000 $20.20000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 12” Adapter (Iron-Iron) $ $25.27000 $20.20000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 15” Adapter (Clay-Clay) $ $39.73000 $38.95000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |15 Adapter (Clay-lron) 3 $39.73000 $38.95000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 15” Adapter (Iron-Iron) $ $39.73000 $38.95000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |18 Adapter (Clay-lron) 3 $87.96000 $79.25000]




Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |21 Adapter (Clay-lron) 3 - $103.01000 $90.35000)
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |24” Adapter (Clay-Iron) $ - $118.03000] $105.85000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |27 Adapter (Clay-lron) 3 - $496.55000]  $415.60000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 4” X 3” Donut $ - $13.35000 $11.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |8 X6 Donut 3 - [NO BID $24.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 20 |4" Sewer Donuts $ - $18.67000 $8.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 10 |6" Sewer Donuts $ - $24.00000 $12.10000
Miscellaneous Sewer 5 8" Sewer Donuts $ - |NOBID $18.15000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |10 Sewer Donuts 3 - [NO BID $42.65000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 18” Sewer Donuts $ - |NOBID $31.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |21 Sewer Donuts 3 - [NO BID $41.25000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 24” Sewer Donuts $ - |NOBID $46.85000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |27 Sewer Donuts 3 - [NO BID $55.40000]
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 33" Sewer Donuts (Iron Adapter) $ - [NOBID $69.80000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |Sanitary Clean-Outs 3 205.00 $220.49000]  $195.65000
4" Lateral Clean-Out w/ Lid (Cast
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 Iron) $ 50.00 $52.94000 $48.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 20 [Manhole Riser Rings Concrete 2° | $ 25.00 $21.62000 $17.50000]
Miscellaneous Sewer 25 [Manhole Riser Rings Concrete 3” | $ 25.00 $25.38000 $21.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 25 |24'x2 172" cast iron riser ring 3 350.00 $375.29000]  $335.00000
Miscellaneous Sewer 25 |24”x3” cast iron riser ring $ 185.00 $202.08000] $185.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 25 |24'x3” plastic riser ring ( straight) | $ - $38.46000 $45.20000]
247XZ 172" plastic riser ring
Miscellaneous Sewer 25 |(tapered) $ - $38.46000 $26.30000
22" Bolt-down Manhole Ring W/ no
Miscellaneous Sewer 10 |lid $ 310.00 $334.72000] $299.50000
24" Manhole Ring & Cover (Cast
Miscellaneous Sewer 20 |iron) $ 355.00 $382.18000] $341.95000
27" Bolt-down Mannhole Ring &
Miscellaneous Sewer 5 Cover $ 495.00 $532.94000] $475.00000
Miscellaneous Sewer 5 |4" Service Saddle $ - $39.39000 $36.65000
Miscellaneous Sewer 5 |6 Service Saddle $ - $52.04000 $46.05000]
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |4 Air Test Pressure Cap $ - $45.00000]  $147.75000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |4 Glue 22.5 Bend $ - $3.29000 $2.75000]
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |4 Glue 45 Bend $ - $3.00000 $2.25000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |4 Heavy Duty Clamps $ - $85.00000 $5.50000)
B Pl Plug SDR - 35 (wing nut
Miscellaneous Sewer 5 style) $ - $18.67000 $14.15000
8 PIPIug SDR - 35 (wing nut
Miscellaneous Sewer 5 style) $ - $32.60000 $27.15000
T2 Clay Donut on PVC 10 PVC
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 Pipe $ - INOBID $25.65000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 15" X 18" Reducer $ - $325.00000 $70.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |24 Adapter 3 - [NO BID $93.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 27" Adapter $ - |NOBID $385.20000
Main Line Cleanouts casting
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 Risers $ 145.00 $153.38000] $132.25000
Miscellaneous Sewer 5 Main Line Cleanout Lids $ 28.00 $27.06000 $25.50000
Miscellaneous Sewer 2 |Steel Plates 4X4 M/H Cut Out $ - [NO BID $650.00000
32" Manhole Ring & Cover (Cast
Miscellaneous Sewer 20 |iron) $ 368.00 $393.53000] $355.85000
32" bolt-down Manhole Ring &
Miscellaneous Sewer 5 Cover $ 425.70 $455.29000f $416.15000
$ 50,801.75 $72,352.33 $65,054.14



